—

~

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA
FEBRUARY 21, 2023
6:00 P.M.

CITY OFFICE BUILDING
214 N. LAFAYETTE, MARSHALL, MO 65340

Roll Call

. Adoption of Agenda

Approve or Correct Regular Session Minutes of February 6, 2023, Work Session Minutes
of February 13, 2023 and Special Session Minutes of February 13, 2023.
Business from the Audience — limited to 3 minutes per speaker. Any person, resident or
non-resident, wishing to address the Council may approach the microphone and state
their name, address and comments. Non-residents are invited to speak first, followed by
residents of the city. Although we are readily available outside our formal meetings, this
will be your only opportunity to offer your thoughts during this evening’s meeting as
comments from the floor will not be taken during the regular meeting. Although
certainly welcome, you are not required to stay for the remainder of the meeting and may
exit the Council Chambers in a quiet and respectful manner.
Committee Reports

1. Property, Finance, Budget and Audit Committee
Community Development and Code Committee
Public Relations and Public Safety Committee
Municipal Services and Personnel Committee
City Administrator’s Report
6. Mayor’s Report

ol ol

. Liquor License

1. My 3 C’s, LLC dba Buds Café — Matt Smith, Managing Officer
Beer and Light Wine By Drink
Event Request
1. Marshall Chamber of Commerce Sips and Grins Wine Walk
May 6, 2023
Ordinances
1. Execute Agreement Between the City of Marshall and Vance Brothers, Inc. for
the Purchase of Paving Fabric — Second Reading
2. Execute Agreement Between the City of Marshall and Vance Brothers, Inc. for
the Slurry Seal of Certain City Streets — Second Reading
3. Execute Agreement Between the City of Marshall and Capital Paving &
Construction, LLC for the Concrete Overlay of Certain City Streets — Second
Reading
4. Execute Agreement Between the City of Marshall and Capital Paving &
Construction, LLC for Cold Milling of Certain Streets - Second Reading
Adopt the 2021 Edition of the International Building Code
Adopt the 2021 Edition of the International Energy Conservation Code
Adopt the 2021 Edition of the International Existing Building Code
Adopt the 2021 Edition of the International Fire Code

O N



9. Adopt the 2021 Edition of the International Fuel Gas Code
10. Adopt the 2021 Edition of the International Mechanical Code
11. Adopt the 2021 Edition of the International Plumbing Code
12. Adopt the 2021 Edition of the International Private Sewage Disposal Code
13. Adopt the 2021 Edition of the International Property Maintenance Code
14. Adopt the 2021 Edition of the International Residential Code
15. Adopt the 2020 Edition of the National Electrical Code
16. Execute Contract with JD Kehrman Extending Employment as City
Administrator of the City of Marshall
17. Authorize Internal Transfer of Balances Between Certain City Funds
18. Appropriation
9. Other Council Business
10. Adjourn

POSTED 02/17/2023
3:00 P.M.



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING AND DIRECTING THE MAYOR OF THE CITY OF
MARSHALL, MISSOURI, TO EXECUTE AN AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE CITY OF
MARSHALL AND VANCE BROTHERS, INC., FOR THE PURCHASE OF PAVING FABRIC

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, as follows:

Section 1. The Mayor of the City of Marshall, Missouri, is hereby authorized to execute on behalf
of said City a Contract with Vance Brothers, Inc., for the purchase of paving fabric for use on certain
City streets as specified by City. The Mayor is hereby further authorized to execute such other documents
as may be necessary in connection with the agreement.

Section 2, If said Contract is executed in accordance with Section 1 above, the City shall, in
consideration for the paving fabric purchased from Vance Brothers, Inc., pay Vance Brothers, Inc., $4.51
per square yard for said paving fabric and such other sums as specified in said agreement.

Section 3. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect upon final passage and approval.

PASSED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, this day of 2023.
President
APPROVED by the Mayor this day of 2023.
Mayor
FILED this day of 2023.

City Clerk



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING AND DIRECTING THE MAYOR OF THE CITY OF
MARSHALL, MISSOURIL, TO EXECUTE AN AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE CITY OF
- MARSHALL AND VANCE BROTHERS, INC,, FOR THE SLURRY SEAL OF CERTAIN CITY
STREETS

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, as follows:

Section 1. The Mayor of the City of Marshall, Missouri, is hereby authorized to execute on behalf
of said City a Contract with Vance Brothers, Inc., for the slurry seal of certain City streets as specified
by City, The Mayor is hereby further authorized to execute such other documents as may be necessary
in connection with the agreement.

Section 2. If said Confract is executed in accordance with Section 1 above, the City shall, in
consideration for the provision of slurry seal by Vance Brothers, Inc., pay Vance Brothers, Inc., $4.28
per square yard for said slurry seal and for such other sums as specified in such agreement.

Section 3. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect upon final passage and approval.

PASSED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, this day of 2023.
President
APPROVED by the Mayor this day of 2023.
Mayor
FILED this day of 2023,

City Clerk



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING AND DIRECTING THE MAYOR OF THE CITY OF
MARSHALL, MISSOURIL, TO EXECUTE AN AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE CITY OF
MARSHALL AND CAPITAL PAVING & CONSTRUCTION, LLC, FOR THE CONCRETE
OVERLAY OF CERTAIN CITY STREETS

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, as follows:

Section 1. The Mayor of the City of Marshall, Missouri, is hereby authorized to execute on behalf
of said City a Contract with Capital Paving & Construction, LLC, for the asphaltic concrete overlay of
certain City streets as specified in the Contract. The Mayor is hereby further authorized to execute such
other documents as may be necessary in connection with the agreement.

Section 2. If said Contract is executed in accordance with Section 1 above, the City shall, in
consideration of the asphaltic concrete overlay provided by Capital Paving & Construction, LLC, pay
Capital Paving & Construction, LI.C, $135.95 per ton for said asphaltic concrete overlay, and such other
sums as set forth in said Agreement.

Section 3. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect upon final passage and approval.

PASSED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, this day of 2023,
President
APPROVED by the Mayor this day of 2023,
Mayor
FILED this day of 2023.

City Clerk



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING AND DIRECTING THE MAYOR OF THE CITY OF
MARSHALL, MISSOURIL, TO EXECUTE AN AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE CITY OF
MARSHALL AND CAPITAL PAVING & CONSTRUCTION LLC, FOR THE COLD
MILLING OF CERTAIN CITY STREETS

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, as follows:

Section 1. The Mayor of the City of Marshall, Missouri, is hereby authorized to execute on behalf
of said City a Contract with Capital Paving & Construction, LLC, for the cold milling of certain City
streets as specified in the Contract. The Mayor is hereby further authorized to execute such other
documents as may be necessary in connection with the agreement.

Section 2. If said Contract is executed in accordance with Section 1 above, the City shall, in
consideration of the cold milling provided by Capital Paving & Construction, LLC, pay Capital Paving
& Construction, LLC, $2.33 per square yard for said cold milling, and such other sums as set forth in
said Agreement.

Section 3. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect upon final passage and approval,

PASSED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, this day of 2023,
President
APPROVED by the Mayor this day of 2023,
Mayor
FILED this day of 2023.

City Clerk



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF MARSHALL, MISSOURI ADOPTING THE 2021
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, REGULATING AND
GOVERNING THE CONDITIONS AND MAINTENANCE OF ALL PROPERTY,
BUILDINGS, AND STRUCTURES; BY PROVIDING THE STANDARDS FOR
SUPPLIED UTILITIES AND FACILITIES AND OTHER PHYSICAL THINGS AND
CONDITIONS ESSENTIAL TO ENSURE THAT STRUCTURES ARE SAFE, SANITARY
AND FIT FOR OCCUPATION AND USE; AND THE CONDEMNATION OF BUILDINGS
AND STRUCTURES UNFIT FOR HUMAN OCCUPANCY AND USE AND THE
DEMOLITION OF SUCH STRUCTURES IN THE CITY OF MARSHALL, MISSOURI;
PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND COLLECTION OF FEES
THEREFOR; REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 8233 AND ALL OTHER ORDINANCES
OR PARTS OF LAWS IN CONFLICT THEREWITH.

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, as follows:

Section 1. Adoption of Building Code. That a certain document, one (1) digital copy of
which is on file in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall, being marked and designated as
the International Building Code, 2021 edition, including Appendix Chapters C, F, G, 1, and
Resource “A” (see International Building Code Section 102.2.1, 2021 edition), as published by
the International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Building Code of the City of
Marshall, Missouri, regulating and governing the conditions and maintenance of all property,
building, and structures; by providing the standards for supplied utilities and facilities and other
physical things and conditions essential to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary and fit for
occupation and use; and the condemnation of buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy
and use and the demolition of such structures as herein provided; providing for the issuance of
permits and collection of fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties,
conditions and terms of said Building Code on file in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall,
Missouri are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this
Ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any prescribe in this Ordinance.

Section 2. Additions, Insertions and Changes. That the sections of the Building Code
are hereby revised:

a. Section 101.1. Insert: The City of Marshall, Missouri.
b. Section 103.1. Insert: City Inspection Department

c. Section 113.1. REVISED TO READ:

113.1 General. Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the
building official relative to the application and interpretation of this Code shall be
heard by the City of Marshall Board of Building Code Enforcement, as established,
adopted and amended from time to time by the City of Marshall, Missouri. The
Board of Building Code Enforcement shall follow the practices and procedures
established for the Board of Building Code Enforcement.

d. Section 113.3. REVISED TO READ:



113.3 Qualifications. The Qualifications to serve on the City’s Board of Building
Code Enforcement shall be as set forth in those City ordinances establishing the
Board of Building Code Enforcement. The Board of Building Code Enforcement
shall follow the practices and procedures established for the Board of Building

Code Enforcement.

e. Section 1612.3. Insert: The City of Marshall, Missouri.

f. Section 1612.3. Insert: January 16, 2013.

g. Section G103.2. Insert: November 4, 1988.

h. Section G101.5 — Code Official

i. Section 109.2. Insert: The building permit fees established by this section shall be
as follows based on Table (1) square foot construction costs:

Square Foot Construction Costs?*¢

|

Group (2018 International Building Code) 1A B a | . 1A {1[1-] N VA VB
A-1 Assembly, thealers, with stage 26306 | 254.15 | 247.565 | 237.563 | 22305 | 216.60 | 22990 | 20742 | 19994
A-1 Assembly, theaters, without stage 241.02 | 232.11 | 22551 | 215.49 | 201.01 | 194.56 | 207.86 | 185.38 | 177.89
A-2 Assembly, nightclubs 205.93 | 199.80 | 194.80 ! 18691 | 176.19 | 171.34 | 180.27 | 15946 | 154.02
A-2 Assembly, restaurants, bars, banguel halls 20493 | 198.80 | 192.89 | 18591 | 174.19 | 170.34 | 179.27 | 157.46 | 153.02
A-3 Assembly, churches 243.83 | 23492 | 228.32 | 218.30 | 20421 | 198.79 | 210.67 | 18858 | 181.10
A-3 Assembly, general, community hails, libraries,

museums 204.02 | 1956.11 | 187.51 | 178.49 | 163.01 | 157.56 | 170.86 | 147.38 | 140.89
A-4 Assembly, arenas 24002 | 231.11 | 223.51 | 21449 | 199.01 | 193.56 | 206.86 | 183.38 | 176.89
B Business 21246 | 204.72 | 197.90 | 188.18 | 171.81 | 165.32 | 180.77 | 151.15 | 144.35
E Educational 22269 | 21499 | 208.81 | 10081 | 18617 { 176.74 | 192.93 | 162.78 | 157.80
F-1 Factory and Induslrial, moderate hazard 125.58 | 119.68 | 112.86 | 108.68 87.37 I 9283 | 104.02 80.23 75.34
F-2 Factory and industrial, low hazard 124.58 | 118.68 | 112.86 | 107.68 97.37 | 9183 | 103.02 80.23 74.34
H-1 High Hazard, explosives 117.37 | 111.47 | 105.65 | 100.47 90.40 8487 . 9581 73.27 N.P.
H234 High Hazard 117.37 | 111.47 | 105.65 | 100.47 | 9040 | 84.87 [ 95.81 7327 | B87.37
H-5 HPM 212.46 | 20472 | 197.90 | 188.18 | 171.81 | 185.32 | 180.77 151.15 | 144.35
-1 Institutional, supervised environment 211.58 | 20434 | 198.27 | 190.28 | 175.02 | 170.20 | 190.53 | 156.95 | 152.25
1-2 Institutional, hospitais 355.95 | 348.21 | 34139 | 33167 | 314.48 N.P. 32426 | 293.82 N.P.
-2 Institutional, nursing homes 247.27 | 239.53 | 232.71 | 22299 ! 20736 | N.P. 215.58 | 186.70 N.P.
13 Inslitutional, restrained 241.59 | 233.85 | 227.03 | 217.31 | 202.46 | 194.97 | 209.90 | 181.80 | 173.00
-4 Institutional, day care faciities 211.58 | 204.34 | 198.27 | 19028 | 175.02 | 170.20 | 19053 | 156.95 | 1562.25
M Mercantile 1563.55 | 147.41 | 141.50 | 134 53 | 123.48 | 119.63 | 127.88 | 106.75 | 102.31
R-1 Residential, hotels 213.59 | 206.35 | 200.28 | 192.29 | 176.78 | 171.95 | 192.54 | 158.70 | 154.00
R-2 Residential, multiple family 179.04 | 171.80 | 165.73 | 157.74 | 143.25 | 13843 | 157.99 | 125.18 | 120.47
R-3 Residential, one- and two-family ° 166.68 | 162.17 | 157.99 | 154.10 | 149.61 | 144.19 | 151.48 | 138.79 | 130.58
R-4 Residential , care/assisted living facilities 211.58 | 20434 | 198.27 | 190.28 | 175.02 | 170.20 | 190.53 | 156.95 | 152.25
S-1 Storage, moderate hazard 116.37 | 110.47 | 103.65 99.47 | 88.40 83.87 94 .81 71.27 66.37
5-2 Storage, low hazard 115.37 | 109.47 | 103.65 9847 | 8840 82.87 93.81 71.2% 65.37
U utility, misceilaneous 89.90 84.75 79.27 l 78.71 I 67.97 63.50 72.24 53.83 51.28

Private Garages use Utility, miscellaneous
For shell only buildings deduct 20 percent
N.P. = not permitted

fRADE

Unfinished basements (Group R-3) = $23.20 per sq. it
Calculate per 1000 sq. fi. to establish permit fee




Section 3. Inconsistent Ordinances Repealed. That Ordinance No. 8233 entitled An
Ordinance of the City of Marshall, Missouri, Adopting the 2015 International Building Code and
all other ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 4. Partial Invalidity. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase
of this ordinance is, for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the
validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance. The Council hereby declares that it would
have passed this ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of
the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared
unconstitutional.

Section 5. Savings Clause. That nothing in this Ordinance or in the Building Code hereby
adopted shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or any rights
acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act
or Ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 3 of this Ordinance; nor shall any just or legal
right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this Ordinance. If any suit or
proceeding, either administrative or judicial, is pending at the time of the enactment of this
Ordinance, the provisions of the repealed Ordinance shall apply to all actions taken on or before
the date of the enactment of this Ordinance, and the newly enacted Ordinance shall apply to all
actions taken in such cause or proceeding after the date of the enactment of this Ordinance.

Section 6. Date of Effect. That this Ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions,
requirements, orders and matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full
force and effect from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.

PASSED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, this _ day of ,2023.
President

APPROVED by the Mayor this  day of , 2023.
Mayor

FILED this _ day of , 2023.

City Clerk



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF MARSHALL, MISSOURI ADOPTING THE 2021
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE,
REGULATING AND GOVERNING ENERGY-EFFICIENT BUILDING ENVELOPES
AND INSTALLATION OF ENERGY-EFFICIENT MECHANICAL, LIGHTING AND
POWER SYSTEMS IN THE CITY OF MARSHALL, MISSOURI; PROVIDING FOR THE
ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND COLLECTION OF FEES THEREFOR; REPEALING
ORDINANCE NO. 8234 AND ALL OTHER ORDINANCES OR PARTS OF LAWS IN
CONFLICT THEREWITH.

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, as follows:

Section 1. Adoption of Energy Conservation Code. That a certain document, one (1)
digital copy of which is on file in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall, being marked and
designated as the International Energy Conservation Code, 2021 edition, as published by the
International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Energy Conservation Code of the City
of Marshall, Missouri, regulating and governing energy-efficient building envelopes and
installation of energy-efficient mechanical, lighting and power systems as herein provided;
providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; and each and all of the
regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Energy Conservation Code on file
in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall, Missouri are hereby referred to, adopted, and
made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions
and changes, if any prescribe in this Ordinance.

Section 2. Additions, Insertions and Changes. That the sections of the Energy
Conversation Code are hereby revised:

a. Sections C101.1 and R101.1. Insert: The City of Marshall, Missouri.
b. Section C109.4. and R109.4. Insert: REVISED TO READ:

Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to
perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject to a fine of not
less than $1.00 and not more than $500.00.

¢. Section C110.1 and R110.1. REVISED TO READ:

General. Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the building
official relative to the application and interpretation of this Code shall be heard by
the City of Marshall Board of Building Code Enforcement, as established, adopted
and amended from time to time by the City of Marshall, Missouri. The Board of
Building Code Enforcement shall follow the practices and procedures established
for the Board of Building Code Enforcement.



d. Section C110.3 and R110.3. REVISED TO READ:

Qualifications. The Qualifications to serve on the City’s Board of Building Code
Enforcement shall be as set forth in those City ordinances establishing the Board of
Building Code Enforcement. The Board of Building Code Enforcement shall
follow the practices and procedures established for the Board of Building Code
Enforcement.

Section 3. Inconsistent Ordinances Repealed. That Ordinance No. 8234 and all other
ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 4. Partial Invalidity. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase
of this ordinance is, for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the
validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance. The Council hereby declares that it would
have passed this ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of
the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared
unconstitutional.

Section 5. Savings Clause. That nothing in this Ordinance or in the Energy Conservation
Code hereby adopted shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or
any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing,
under any act or Ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 3 of this Ordinance; nor shall any
just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this Ordinance. If
any suit or proceeding, either administrative or judicial, is pending at the time of the enactment of
this Ordinance, the provisions of the repealed Ordinance shall apply to all actions taken on or
before the date of the enactment of this Ordinance, and the newly enacted Ordinance shall apply
to all actions taken in such cause or proceeding after the date of the enactment of this Ordinance.

Section 6. Date of Effect. That this Ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions,
requirements, orders and matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full
force and effect from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.

PASSED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, this  day of ,2023.
President

APPROVED by the Mayor this  day of ,2023.
Mayor

FILED this _ day of , 2023.

City Clerk



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF MARSHALL, MISSOURI ADOPTING THE 2021
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE, REGULATING
AND GOVERNING THE REPAIR, ALTERATION, CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY,
ADDITION AND RELOCATION OF EXISTING BUILDINGS, INCLUDING HISTORIC
BUILDINGS, IN THE CITY OF MARSHALL, MISSOURI; PROVIDING FOR THE
ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND COLLECTION OF FEES THEREFOR; REPEALING
ALL OTHER ORDINANCES OR PARTS OF LAWS IN CONFLICT THEREWITH.

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, as follows:

Section 1. Adoption of Existing Building Code. That a certain document, one (1) digital
copy of which is on file in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall, being marked and
designated as the International Existing Building Code, 2021 edition, including Appendix B and
Resource A (see International Existing Building Code Section 101.6, 2021 edition), as published
by the International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Existing Building Code of the
City of Marshall, Missouri, for regulating and governing the repair, alteration, change of
occupancy, addition and relocation of existing buildings, including historic buildings, as herein
provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; and each and all
of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Existing Building Code on
file in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall, Missouri are hereby referred to, adopted,
and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Ordinance, with the additions, insertions,
deletions and changes, if any prescribe in this Ordinance.

Section 2. Additions, Insertions and Changes. That the Existing Building Code is
amended and changed in the following respects:

a. Section 101.1: Insert: The City of Marshall, Missouri.
b. Section 112.1. Insert: REVISED TO READ:

112.1 General. Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the
building official relative to the application and interpretation of this Code shall be
heard by the City of Marshall Board of Building Code Enforcement, as
established, adopted and amended from time to time by the City of Marshall,
Missouri. The Board of Building Code Enforcement shall follow the practices and
procedures established for the Board of Building Code Enforcement.

¢. Section 112.3. Insert: REVISED TO READ:

112.3 Membership, Qualifications and Procedures. The Qualifications to serve
on the City’s Board of Building Code Enforcement shall be as set forth in those
City ordinances establishing the Board of Building Code Enforcement. The Board
of Building Code Enforcement shall follow the practices and procedures
established for the Board of Building Code Enforcement.



Section 3. Inconsistent Ordinances Repealed. That all ordinances or parts of
ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 4. Partial Invalidity. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase
of this ordinance is, for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the
validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance. The Council hereby declares that it would
have passed this ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of
the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared
unconstitutional.

Section 5. Savings Clause. That nothing in this Ordinance or in the Existing Building
Code hereby adopted shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or
any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing,
under any act or Ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 3 of this Ordinance; nor shall any
just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this Ordinance. If
any suit or proceeding, either administrative or judicial, is pending at the time of the enactment
of this Ordinance, the provisions of the repealed Ordinance shall apply to all actions taken on or
before the date of the enactment of this Ordinance, and the newly enacted Ordinance shall apply
to all actions taken in such cause or proceeding after the date of the enactment of this Ordinance.

Section 6. Date of Effect. That this Ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions,
requirements, orders and matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full
force and effect from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.

PASSED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, this  day of ,
2023.

President

APPROVED by the Mayor this  day of ,2023.

Mayor

FILED this __ day of ,2023.

City Clerk



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF MARSHALL, MISSOURI ADOPTING THE 2021
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, REGULATING AND GOVERNING
THE SAFEGUARDING OF LIFE AND PROPERTY FROM FIRE AND EXPLOSION
HAZARDS ARISING FROM THE STORAGE, HANDLING AND USE OF HAZARDOUS
SUBSTANCES, MATERIALS AND DEVICES; AND FROM CONDITIONS
HAZARDOUS TO LIFE OR PROPERTY IN THE OCCUPANCY OF BUILDINGS AND
PREMISES IN THE CITY OF MARSHALL, MISSOURI; PROVIDING FOR THE
ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND COLLECTION OF FEES THEREFOR; REPEALING
ORDINANCE NO. 8236 AND ALL OTHER ORDINANCES OR PARTS OF LAWS IN
CONFLICT THEREWITH.

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, as follows:

Section 1. Adoption of Fire Code. That a certain document, one (1) digital copy of which
is on file in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall, being marked and designated as the
International Fire Code, 2021 edition, including Appendix Chapters B, C, D, E, and F, as
published by the International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Fire Code of the City
of Marshall, Missouri, regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire
and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances,
materials and devices; and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of
buildings and premises in the City of Marshall, Missouri; providing for the issuance of permits
and collection of fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions
and terms of said Fire Code on file in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall, Missouri are
hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Ordinance, with the
additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any prescribe in this Ordinance.

Section 2. Additions, Insertions and Changes. That the sections of the Fire Code are
hereby revised:

a. Section 101.1. Insert: The City of Marshall, Missouri.
b. Section [A]111.1. REVISED TO READ:

111.1 General. Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the
building official relative to the application and interpretation of this Code shall be
heard by the City of Marshall Board of Building Code Enforcement, as established,
adopted and amended from time to time by the City of Marshall, Missouri. The
Board of Building Code Enforcement shall follow the practices and procedures
established for the Board of Building Code Enforcement.

c. Section [A]111.3. REVISED TO READ:

111.3 Qualifications. The Qualifications to serve on the City’s Board of Building
Code Enforcement shall be as set forth in those City ordinances establishing the



Board of Building Code Enforcement. The Board of Building Code Enforcement
shall follow the practices and procedures established for the Board of Building
Code Enforcement.

d. Section [A]112.4. Insert: Misdemeanor, $500.00, 90 days.
e. Section 1103.5.3. Insert: Date by which sprinkler system must be installed.
f. Section 5601.1. REVISED TO READ.

The manufacture, display, sale, possession or discharge of fireworks shall comply
with the provisions of City Ordinance Nos. 5745, 7791, and 8518, as amended from
time to time, and, to the extent not inconsistent with said ordinances, with the
provisions of this chapter.

Section 3. Establishment of Limits. That the geographic limits referred to in certain
sections of the 2021 International Fire Code are hereby established as follows:

Section 5704.2.9.6.1 (geographic limits in which the storage of Class I and Class II liquids
in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited): No applicable limit other than as
set forth in this Code and other Codes and Ordinances of the City of Marshall, Missouri.

Section 5706.2.4.4 (geographic limits in which the storage of Class I and Class II liquids
in above-ground tanks is prohibited): No applicable limit other than as set forth in this Code
and other Codes and Ordinances of the City of Marshall, Missouri.

Section 5806.2 (geographic limits in which the storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in
stationary containers is prohibited): No applicable limit other than as set forth in this Code
and other Codes and Ordinances of the City of Marshall, Missouri.

Section 6104.2 (geographic limits in which the storage of liquefied petroleum gas is
restricted for the protection of heavily populated or congested areas): No applicable limit
other than as set forth in this Code and other Codes and Ordinances of the City of Marshall,
Missouri.

Section 4. Inconsistent Ordinances Repealed. That Ordinance No. 8236 and all other
ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 5. Partial Invalidity. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase
of this ordinance is, for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the
validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance. The Council hereby declares that it would
have passed this ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of
the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared
unconstitutional.



Section 6. Savings Clause. That nothing in this Ordinance or in the Fire Code hereby
adopted shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or any rights
acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act
or Ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 4 of this Ordinance; nor shall any just or legal
right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this Ordinance. If any suit or
proceeding, either administrative or judicial, is pending at the time of the enactment of this
Ordinance, the provisions of the repealed Ordinance shall apply to all actions taken on or before
the date of the enactment of this Ordinance, and the newly enacted Ordinance shall apply to all
actions taken in such cause or proceeding after the date of the enactment of this Ordinance.

Section 7. Date of Effect. That this Ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions,
requirements, orders and matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full
force and effect from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.

PASSED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, this  day of ,2023.
President

APPROVED by the Mayor this _ day of ,2023.
Mayor

FILED this _ day of ,2023.

City Clerk



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF MARSHALL, MISSOURI ADOPTING THE 2021
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE, REGULATING AND
GOVERNING FUEL GAS SYSTEMS AND GAS-FIRED APPLIANCES IN THE CITY OF
MARSHALL, MISSOURI; PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND
COLLECTION OF FEES THEREFOR; REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 8237 AND ALL
OTHER ORDINANCES OR PARTS OF LAWS IN CONFLICT THEREWITH.

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, as follows:

Section 1. Adoption of Fuel Gas Code. That a certain document, one (1) digital copy of
which is on file in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall, being marked and designated as the
International Fuel Gas Code, 2021 edition, including Appendix A, B, C, and D (see International
Fuel Gas Code Section 101.3, 2021 edition), as published by the International Code Council, be and
is hereby adopted as the Fuel Gas Code of the City of Marshall, Missouri, regulating and governing
fuel gas systems and gas-fired appliances as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits
and collection of fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions
and terms of said Fuel Gas Code on file in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall, Missouri
are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Ordinance, with the
additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any prescribe in this Ordinance.

Section 2. Additions, Insertions and Changes. That the sections of the Fuel Gas Code are
hereby revised:

a. Section 101.1. Insert: The City of Marshall, Missouri.

b. [A] 103.1 Creation of agency. Insert: Inspection Department.
c. Section 115.4. Insert: Misdemeanor, $500.00, 90 days.

d. Section 113.1. REVISED TO READ:

113.1 General. Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the building
official relative to the application and interpretation of this Code shall be heard by the
City of Marshall Board of Building Code Enforcement, as established, adopted and
amended from time to time by the City of Marshall, Missouri. The Board of Building
Code Enforcement shall follow the practices and procedures established for the Board
of Building Code Enforcement.

e. Section 114.1 inclusive: REVISED TO READ:

114.1 Membership, Qualifications and Procedures. The Qualifications to serve on
the City’s Board of Building Code Enforcement shall be as set forth in those City
ordinances establishing the Board of Building Code Enforcement. The Board of
Building Code Enforcement shall follow the practices and procedures established for
the Board of Building Code Enforcement.



Section 3. Inconsistent Ordinances Repealed. That Ordinance No. 8237 and all other
ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 4. Partial Invalidity. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of
this ordinance is, for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity
of the remaining portions of this Ordinance. The Council hereby declares that it would have passed
this ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any
one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

Section 5. Savings Clause. That nothing in this Ordinance or in the Fuel Gas Code hereby
adopted shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or any rights
acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or
Ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 3 of this Ordinance; nor shall any just or legal right or
remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this Ordinance. If any suit or proceeding,
either administrative or judicial, is pending at the time of the enactment of this Ordinance, the
provisions of the repealed Ordinance shall apply to all actions taken on or before the date of the
enactment of this Ordinance, and the newly enacted Ordinance shall apply to all actions taken in such
cause or proceeding after the date of the enactment of this Ordinance.

Section 6. Date of Effect. That this Ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions,
requirements, orders and matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force
and effect from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.

PASSED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, this  day of , 2023.
President

APPROVED by the Mayor this  day of , 2023.
Mayor

FILED this _ day of , 2023.

City Clerk



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF MARSHALL, MISSOURI ADOPTING THE 2021
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE, REGULATING AND
GOVERNING THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION, QUALITY OF MATERIALS,
ERECTION, INSTALLATION, ALTERATION, REPAIR, LOCATION, RELOCATION,
REPLACEMENT, ADDITION TO, USE OR MAINTENANCE OF MECHANICAL
SYSTEMS IN THE CITY OF MARSHALL, MISSOURI; PROVIDING FOR THE
ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND COLLECTION OF FEES THEREFOR; REPEALING
ORDINANCE NO. 8238 AND ALL OTHER ORDINANCES OR PARTS OF LAWS IN
CONFLICT THEREWITH.

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, as follows:

Section 1. Adoption of Mechanical Code. That a certain document, one (1) digital copy
of which is on file in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall, being marked and designated
as the International Mechanical Code, 2021 edition, including Appendix A, as published by the
International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Mechanical Code of the City of
Marshall, Missouri, regulating and governing the design, construction, quality of materials,
erection, installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or
maintenance of mechanical systems as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and
collection of fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions
and terms of said Mechanical Code on file in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall,
Missouri are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this
Ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any prescribe in this Ordinance.

Section 2. Additions, Insertions and Changes. That the sections of the Mechanical Code
are hereby revised:

a. Section 101.1. Insert: The City of Marshall, Missouri.
b. [A]103.1 Insert: City Inspection Department.

¢. Section 109.2. Insert: The fees for mechanical work shall be as indicated in the
following schedule:

Air Condition Units <2 ton............... ..... $10.00
Air Condition Units > 2 ton............... ..... $15.00
Boilers —H.P. €a. .....ccoeovvveviriiecieenn e $20.00
Furnaces/Ht. Pumps < 100M Btu...... ..... $10.00
Furnaces/Ht. Pumps > 100M Btu....... ..... $15.00
Floor Furnaces — B.T.U. ....cc.cccovvvvenns .. $10.00
Unit Heaters — B.T.U. (M)....c..ccceuven ... $10.00
Range Hood.........ccocovevvieiiiiiiiciieien e, $5.00
Fans .....cooooovveieieeeeeeeeeeeeee e, $2.50

Gas Piping........cccoveeveevieeeeiieieeeens e $10.00



Diffuser/Register ........cooevveeiecuieiiieien e $1.00
Minimum Fee.....ccooovvvvvvviiieiiieciieeen e $10.00
Maximum Fee .......c.ccooovvvviiiicieiiees e $200.00

d. [A] 109.6 Refunds. The code official is authorized to establish a refund policy.
e. Section 115.4. Insert: Misdemeanor, $500.00, 90 days.

f. [A] 113.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having
been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to
perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject to fines
established by the authority having jurisdiction.

g. Section 114.1. REVISED TO READ:

114.1 General. Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the
building official relative to the application and interpretation of this Code shall be
heard by the City of Marshall Board of Building Code Enforcement, as established,
adopted and amended from time to time by the City of Marshall, Missouri. The
Board of Building Code Enforcement shall follow the practices and procedures
established for the Board of Building Code Enforcement.

h. Section 114.3, inclusive. REVISED TO READ:

114.3 Qualifications. The Qualifications to serve on the City’s Board of Building
Code Enforcement shall be as set forth in those City ordinances establishing the
Board of Building Code Enforcement. The Board of Building Code Enforcement
shall follow the practices and procedures established for the Board of Building
Code Enforcement.

Section 3. Inconsistent Ordinances Repealed. That Ordinance No. 8238 and all other
ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 4. Partial Invalidity. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase
of this ordinance is, for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the
validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance. The Council hereby declares that it would
have passed this ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of
the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared
unconstitutional.

Section 5. Savings Clause. That nothing in this Ordinance or in the Mechanical Code
hereby adopted shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or any
rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under
any act or Ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 3 of this Ordinance; nor shall any just or
legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this Ordinance. If any suit
or proceeding, either administrative or judicial, is pending at the time of the enactment of this



Ordinance, the provisions of the repealed Ordinance shall apply to all actions taken on or before
the date of the enactment of this Ordinance, and the newly enacted Ordinance shall apply to all
actions taken in such cause or proceeding after the date of the enactment of this Ordinance.

Section 6. Date of Effect. That this Ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions,
requirements, orders and matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full
force and effect from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.

PASSED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, this  day of ,2023.
President

APPROVED by the Mayor this  day of ,2023.
Mayor

FILED this _ day of ,2023.

City Clerk



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF MARSHALL, MISSOURI ADOPTING THE 2021
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, REGULATING AND
GOVERNING THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION, QUALITY OF MATERIALS,
ERECTION, INSTALLATION, ALTERATION, REPAIR, LOCATION, RELOCATION,
REPLACEMENT, ADDITION TO, USE OR MAINTENANCE OF PLUMBING
SYSTEMS IN THE CITY OF MARSHALL, MISSOURI; PROVIDING FOR THE
ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND COLLECTION OF FEES THEREFOR; REPEALING
ORDINANCE NO. 8239 AND ALL OTHER ORDINANCES OR PARTS OF LAWS IN
CONFLICT THEREWITH.

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, as follows:

Section 1. Adoption of Plumbing Code. That a certain document, one (1) digital copy of
which is on file in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall, being marked and designated as
the International Plumbing Code, 2021 edition, including Appendix B, and E, as published by
the International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Plumbing Code of the City of
Marshall, Missouri, regulating and governing the design, construction, quality of materials,
erection, installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or
maintenance of plumbing systems as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and
collection of fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions
and terms of said Plumbing Code on file in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall,
Missouri are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this
Ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any prescribe in this
Ordinance.

Section 2. Additions, Insertions and Changes. That the sections of the Plumbing Code
are hereby revised:

a. Section 101.1. Insert: The City of Marshall, Missouri.
b. Section [A]109.2. Insert:

The fees for all plumbing work shall be as indicated in the following schedule:

INEW SEWET ..cnviviiieeieiteiieieste ettt esaessessesseeeeeseeneeneas $5.00
Sewer Repair, Replace.........ccocveveevieieieieieiecieeeeeeeeveeee $5.00
SePtic TaANK .....c.occvieuiiiieiiciieieeeeeete e $10.00
WALET SEIVICE....cueeviiinieiietiieiete ettt eee s $5.00
Gas DiStribDUtION .......c.ceieieieierieeieceeeeeee e $5.00
Heating or cooling ventilating system, each..........c..ccccceueenee. $5.00
StO0], €ACH.......eiiiieiiieee e $2.00
* Each additional fiXtUre.........coocvevveeeieierieiececeeeeeeeeena $2.00
*¥ RE-INSPECTION ...ttt $5.00

IMINIMUM FEE ..o $10.00



g.

h.

MAXIMUIM FEE ...t $200.00

* Additional fixtures include, but are not limited to, bath tubs, lavatory,
shower stall, sinks, disposals floor drain, laundry machine, water fountain,
urinal-men, urinal-women, water heater, gas fixtures, etc.

ok Re-inspection means that Inspector has to re-inspect plumbing because of
change needed to meet code requirements.

Section 109.5. Insert: Twenty-five Percent (25%).
Section 115.4. Insert: Misdemeanor, $500.00, 90 days.
Section 114.1: REVISED TO READ:

114.1 General. Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the
building official relative to the application and interpretation of this Code shall be
heard by the City of Marshall Board of Building Code Enforcement, as
established, adopted and amended from time to time by the City of Marshall,
Missouri. The Board of Building Code Enforcement shall follow the practices and
procedures established for the Board of Building Code Enforcement.

Section 114.3: REVISED TO READ:

114.3 Membership, Qualifications and Procedures. The Qualifications to serve
on the City’s Board of Building Code Enforcement shall be as set forth in those
City ordinances establishing the Board of Building Code Enforcement. The Board
of Building Code Enforcement shall follow the practices and procedures
established for the Board of Building Code Enforcement.

Section 305.4.1. Insert: Eighteen Inches (18”) — Eighteen Inches (18”).

Section 903.1.1 Insert: Twelve Inches (127)

Section 3. Inconsistent Ordinances Repealed. That Ordinance No. 8239 and all other
ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 4. Partial Invalidity. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase
of this ordinance is, for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the
validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance. The Council hereby declares that it would
have passed this ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of
the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared
unconstitutional.

Section 5. Savings Clause. That nothing in this Ordinance or in the Plumbing Code
hereby adopted shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or any



rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under
any act or Ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 3 of this Ordinance; nor shall any just or
legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this Ordinance. If any suit
or proceeding, either administrative or judicial, is pending at the time of the enactment of this
Ordinance, the provisions of the repealed Ordinance shall apply to all actions taken on or before
the date of the enactment of this Ordinance, and the newly enacted Ordinance shall apply to all
actions taken in such cause or proceeding after the date of the enactment of this Ordinance.

Section 6. Date of Effect. That this Ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions,
requirements, orders and matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full
force and effect from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.

PASSED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, this  day of ,
2023.

President

APPROVED by the Mayor this  day of , 2023.

Mayor

FILED this __ day of ,2023.

City Clerk



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF MARSHALL, MISSOURI ADOPTING THE 2021
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL PRIVATE SEWAGE DISPOSAL CODE,
REGULATING AND GOVERNING THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION, QUALITY OF
MATERIALS, ERECTION, INSTALLATION, ALTERATION, REPAIR, LOCATION,
RELOCATION, REPLACEMENT, ADDITION TO, USE OR MAINTENANCE OF
INDIVIDUAL SEWAGE DISPOSAL SYSTEMS IN THE CITY OF MARSHALL,
MISSOURI; PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND COLLECTION
OF FEES THEREFOR; REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 8240 AND ALL OTHER
ORDINANCES OR PARTS OF LAWS IN CONFLICT THEREWITH.

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, as follows:

Section 1. Adoption of Private Sewage Disposal Code. That a certain document, one
(1) digital copy of which is on file in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall, being
marked and designated as the International Private Sewage Disposal Code, 2021 edition,
including Appendix A and B, as published by the International Code Council, be and is hereby
adopted as the Private Sewage Disposal Code of the City of Marshall, Missouri, regulating and
governing the design, construction, quality of materials, erection, installation, alteration, repair,
location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of individual sewage disposal
systems as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor;
and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Private
Sewage Disposal Code on file in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall, Missouri are
hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Ordinance, with the
additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any prescribe in this Ordinance.

Section 2. Additions, Insertions and Changes. That the Private Sewage Disposal Code
is amended and changed in the following respects:

a. Section 101.1: Insert: The City of Marshall, Missouri.

b. Section 106.4.2: REVISED TO READ:
The fees for work shall be as indicated in the Plumbing Code.

c. Section 106.4.3. Insert: Twenty-five Percent (25%), Twenty-five Percent (25%).

d. Section 112.1: REVISED TO READ:
112.1 General. Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the
building official relative to the application and interpretation of this Code shall be
heard by the City of Marshall Board of Building Code Enforcement, as
established, adopted and amended from time to time by the City of Marshall,

Missouri. The Board of Building Code Enforcement shall follow the practices and
procedures established for the Board of Building Code Enforcement.



e. Section 112.3to 113.1: REVISED TO READ:

112.3 Membership, Qualifications and Procedures. The Qualifications to serve
on the City’s Board of Building Code Enforcement shall be as set forth in those
City ordinances establishing the Board of Building Code Enforcement. The Board
of Building Code Enforcement shall follow the practices and procedures
established for the Board of Building Code Enforcement.

f. Section 405.2.5. Insert: April 15, April 30, May 15.
g. Section 405.2.6. Insert: April 15.

Section 3. INCONSISTENT ORDINANCES REPEALED. That Ordinance No. 8240
and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 4. PARTIAL INVALIDITY. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or
phrase of this ordinance is, for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not
affect the validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance. The Council hereby declares that
it would have passed this ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof,
irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases
be declared unconstitutional.

Section 5. SAVINGS CLAUSE. That nothing in this Ordinance or in the International
Private Sewage Disposal Code hereby adopted shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding
pending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action
acquired or existing, under any act or Ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 3 of this
Ordinance; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or
affected by this Ordinance. If any suit or proceeding, either administrative or judicial, is pending
at the time of the enactment of this Ordinance, the provisions of the repealed Ordinance shall
apply to all actions taken on or before the date of the enactment of this Ordinance, and the newly
enacted Ordinance shall apply to all actions taken in such cause or proceeding after the date of
the enactment of this Ordinance.

Section 6. DATE OF EFFECT. That this Ordinance and the rules, regulations,
provisions, requirements, orders and matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and
be in full force and effect from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.

PASSED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, this  day of ,
2023.

President



APPROVED by the Mayor this  day of , 2023.

Mayor

FILED this __ day of ,2023.

City Clerk



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF MARSHALL, MISSOURI ADOPTING THE 2021
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE,
REGULATING AND GOVERNING THE CONDITIONS AND MAINTENANCE OF ALL
PROPERTY, BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES; BY PROVIDING THE STANDARDS
FOR SUPPLIED UTILITIES AND FACILITIES AND OTHER PHYSICAL THINGS AND
CONDITIONS ESSENTIAL TO ENSURE THAT STRUCTURES ARE SAFE, SANITARY
AND FIT FOR OCCUPATION AND USE; AND THE CONDEMNATION OF BUILDINGS
AND STRUCTURES UNFIT FOR HUMAN OCCUPANCY AND USE, AND THE
DEMOLITION OF SUCH EXISTING STRUCTURES IN THE CITY OF MARSHALL,
MISSOURI; PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND COLLECTION OF
FEES THEREFOR; REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 8241 AND ALL OTHER
ORDINANCES OR PARTS OF LAWS IN CONFLICT THEREWITH.

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, as follows:

Section 1. Adoption of Property Maintenance Code. That a certain document, one (1)
digital copy of which is on file in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall, being marked and
designated as the International Property Maintenance Code, 2021 edition, as published by the
International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Property Maintenance Code of the
City of Marshall, Missouri, regulating and governing the conditions and maintenance of all
property, buildings and structures; by providing the standards for supplied utilities and facilities
and other physical things and conditions essential to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary and
fit for occupation and use; and the condemnation of buildings and structures unfit for human
occupancy and use, and the demolition of such existing structures as herein provided; providing
for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations,
provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Property Maintenance Code on file in the office
of the Clerk of the City of Marshall, Missouri are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part
hereof, as if fully set out in this Ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes,
if any prescribe in this Ordinance.

Section 2. Additions, Insertions, and Changes. That the sections of the Property
Maintenance Code are hereby revised:

a. Section 101.1. Insert: The City of Marshall, Missouri.

b. Section [A] 103.1 Creation of agency. City Inspection Department.
c. Section 302.4. Insert: Eight Inches (8”).

d. Section 304.14. Insert: April 1, December 1.

e. Section 602.3. Insert: October 1, May 15.

f. Section 602.4. Insert: October 1, May 15.



g. Section 107.1. Insert: REVISED TO READ:

107.1 General. Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the
building official relative to the application and interpretation of this Code shall be
heard by the City of Marshall Board of Building Code Enforcement, as established,
adopted and amended from time to time by the City of Marshall, Missouri. The
Board of Building Code Enforcement shall follow the practices and procedures
established for the Board of Building Code Enforcement.

h. Section 107.3, inclusive. Insert: REVISED TO READ:

107.3 Membership, Qualifications and Procedures. The Qualifications to serve
on the City’s Board of Building Code Enforcement shall be as set forth in those
City ordinances establishing the Board of Building Code Enforcement. The Board
of Building Code Enforcement shall follow the practices and procedures
established for the Board of Building Code Enforcement.

Section 3. Inconsistent Ordinances Repealed. That Ordinance No. 8241 and all other
ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 4. Partial Invalidity. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase
of this ordinance is, for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the
validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance. The Council hereby declares that it would
have passed this ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of
the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared
unconstitutional.

Section 5. Savings Clause. That nothing in this Ordinance or in the Property Maintenance
Code hereby adopted shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or
any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing,
under any act or Ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 3 of this Ordinance; nor shall any
just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this Ordinance. If
any suit or proceeding, either administrative or judicial, is pending at the time of the enactment of
this Ordinance, the provisions of the repealed Ordinance shall apply to all actions taken on or
before the date of the enactment of this Ordinance, and the newly enacted Ordinance shall apply
to all actions taken in such cause or proceeding after the date of the enactment of this Ordinance.

Section 6. Date of Effect. That this Ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions,
requirements, orders and matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full

force and effect from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.

PASSED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, this  day of ,2023.

President



APPROVED by the Mayor this  day of ,2023.

Mayor

FILED this __ day of ,2023.

City Clerk



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF MARSHALL, MISSOURI ADOPTING THE 2021
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, REGULATING AND
GOVERNING THE CONSTRUCTION, ALTERATION, MOVEMENT, ENLARGEMENT,
REPLACEMENT, REPAIR, EQUIPMENT, LOCATION, REMOVAL AND DEMOLITION
OF DETACHED ONE AND TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MULTIPLE SINGLE
FAMILY DWELLINGS (TOWNHOUSES) NOT MORE THAN THREE STORIES IN
HEIGHT WITH SEPARATE MEANS OF EGRESS IN THE CITY OF MARSHALL,
MISSOURI; PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND COLLECTION OF
FEES THEREFOR; REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 8242 AND ALL OTHER
ORDINANCES OR PARTS OF LAWS IN CONFLICT THEREWITH.

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, as follows:

Section 1. Adoption of Residential Code. That a certain document, one (1) digital copy of
which is on file in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall, being marked and designated as the
International Residential Code, 2021 edition, including Appendix Chapters AA, AB, AC, AD, AE,
AH, Al AJ, AK, and AN, as published by the International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted
as the Residential Code of the City of Marshall, Missouri, regulating and governing the construction,
alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, location, removal, and
demolition of detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings
(townhouses) not more than three stories in height with separate means of egress as herein provided;
providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; and each and all of the
regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Residential Code on file in the office
of the Clerk of the City of Marshall, Missouri are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof,
as if fully set out in this Ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any
prescribe in this Ordinance.

Section 2. Additions, Insertions and Changes. That the sections of the Residential Code are
hereby revised:

a. Section R101.1. Insert: The City of Marshall, Missouri.
b. Section R112.1. REVISED TO READ:

R112.1 General. Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the building
official relative to the application and interpretation of this Code shall be heard by the
City of Marshall Board of Building Code Enforcement, as established, adopted and
amended from time to time by the City of Marshall, Missouri. The Board of Building
Code Enforcement shall follow the practices and procedures established for the Board
of Building Code Enforcement.

¢. Section R112.3. REVISED TO READ:

R112.3 Qualifications. The Qualifications to serve on the City’s Board of Building
Code Enforcement shall be as set forth in those City ordinances establishing the Board



of Building Code Enforcement. The Board of Building Code Enforcement shall follow
the practices and procedures established for the Board of Building Code Enforcement.

d. Section R301.2. Insert: Table R301.2, (Attachment “A”).
e. Section P2603.5.1. Insert: Eighteen inches (18”)/Eighteen inches (18”).

Section 3. Inconsistent Ordinances Repealed. That Ordinance No. 8242 and all other
ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 4. Partial Invalidity. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of
this ordinance is, for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity
of the remaining portions of this Ordinance. The Council hereby declares that it would have passed
this ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any
one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

Section 5. Savings Clause. That nothing in this Ordinance or in the Residential Code hereby
adopted shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or any rights
acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or
Ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 3 of this Ordinance; nor shall any just or legal right or
remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this Ordinance. If any suit or proceeding,
either administrative or judicial, is pending at the time of the enactment of this Ordinance, the
provisions of the repealed Ordinance shall apply to all actions taken on or before the date of the
enactment of this Ordinance, and the newly enacted Ordinance shall apply to all actions taken in such
cause or proceeding after the date of the enactment of this Ordinance.

Section 6. Date of Effect. That this Ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions,
requirements, orders and matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force
and effect from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.

PASSED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, this  day of ,2023.
President

APPROVED by the Mayor this  day of ,2023.
Mayor

FILED this _ day of ,2023.

City Clerk



BUILDING PLANNING

"S1qe) oY) JO 11ed SIG3 W, ON, JILIIPUL J[BYS #ORIpsLanS 9} ‘ISLATIEIQ *(S)9U0Z PUIM STIqSp SUIOq-DPULMA 21 S]EOHNIL [[BYS uoyopsiind 911 *1'Z 17 TOSY UON0SS (3l S9UEPIesse T X
*apqey o0 70 Jxed ST UL, ON],, SFROIPUI [[BYS H4OXOPSLIR ST ‘OSIMIYL) 'sfueuzarmbel
agroads A Apuspt pue (SHA,, YA S[qel og) Jo 1red ST W [ [[eYs “oyoipst.or 2y ‘SIORIPUS PULA (NS SURUSWRIOp Bep [E3LIOISIY [#50] §1 2181 s19GM “V(};)7 [0EY emBly 1M S0UEPIOasE B T
214} 91 JO 1ed ST W ON.. SIESTPUL [6YS HopRipstinf o) SIMISC . SHA., (I 98}
aq 30 ped S UL [[ Treys uoyopstal o ‘510830 do-psads pups smderSodoy of snp sSuppiing o0y 28ewep [erongs SURNATEMIOP BJEp TRSLICIST [290] 51 Q131 S ‘' 1T 10N WON0OS Iy S0UBPIOsoR I Y
« (1TE 2526 PORSI VE-xapuy Surzeald Iry,, opger BIEp 1o9us)) BIB(] SHIT) [BUOTRN ST WOl amyessdius) [enure Geanr o [ty ofqe 293 30 1red sTqy UL [T Teys wonpstaf oqs.
«(doTE 994 POMOIN VS[1-X2PU] STIZoal] IV, 21qe} B1ep 181027
eed OBEIL) [RUOHEN o1 U0 aryea (Juedlad 46) 1La4-00[ 973 WOT 10 (T} C0¥¥ AnBiy woy (34rp-19) ¥epur Fuizess are porsed ummay Ieak-0(1 S YILA [qE} a4 JO 3ed ST UL [ [[BUS uoyoipsLinl oL, T
« ONL, TEs afqey o 30 31ad ST UL T ([0S wonoipsiued o) ‘SSIAISTRO  SHA,, s 2]q7) 511 Jo wed st up 1y
TeYs Hoxompsient o ‘Buraimep 5o Jo S]934R 94 WO SFewrvp [e20] JO AT0ISY § T2q SEY 2197 AIAGA ¢S SO6T PUR 1°€°L'S06H ‘1 €'9°S06E ‘1€ S06 “I"€F'S064 ‘7' 1”506 SUORISE LA 20UEPIoI0E W
‘pepuUswIe Se ‘UoyIpsnl
Supary Huoyne of) Aq poydope dem prezey pooy J9TI0 To SWAH PUE SPTHI SAR0ge A[JUoLmo o1 Jo sayep pus swoquny jaued oy) (0) pue Apryg sowemsuy pooly oy Jo (s)arep o1y (q) “(seoae pIezer Poo[i
3O JUOTIASEHELL 103 SUBGIPID 10 2P0 51T o Jo nendope jo o1ep) WeiSoly 29URMST] pOo] [EUCTEN SU1 OJUT ATUs 5, uopaipsLa oY) JO 018D o) (B) mim =1qe} sy yo 1red sig1 U1 [ [[eyS wonowsLer Byl S
"T'TT 106 UOT09S WOy pIulmIdep Ax05ares GSIsep onIstes o3 Ui o[ge) ot Jo ued SIq O [T [[eys wopsipsial oYL 3
Jioyld Swippng ST £q PITUIINGP St 2ouIade XaTIeam TEOOf 10 SOJERUIYD TEOOf 195]18Y 01 peyruirad oq {jeys sommreredia)
(I xipusddy om) woxy swoneaa(q 3P0 Sutqumy g jpuonvuisiuy o) Jo (f ¥1praddy Woly Joprs 10§ sanfea wrantad-¥ 46 JO STUMICO 97} TWOY P3193[9s a4 [ugs anmjeiadms) qna-A1p uSissp 100pmo Sy, -2
PUTT0Ed U0R02E LA

(Attachment a)

9IUTPIOIT UF SISy 0yroads-211s 2 W0 PIWImIRAp 2q [[eys Arofoyes omsodxs purm, “[y(y)7 106d emBry] dew psads puia orseq oy W0 poads puzs 2] gL 7qe1 21 Jo 10ed STq) 1 [ [[egs wogopsinfeq], P
"o TIIEp AIULD] TSNS Teo0] Jo AI0JSTY B U80q S 2197} Ioqeym to Surpradap wogostord 103 posU oU aredtpul of 2qes 9t o 1ed ST UT I [0S wonopstnl 4], o
“Dpp.43 Usug soreq Supoc Fo dep tuoururm 3y qrLm Twnoa dep oul 380 s ur [y [Teys wouopstanl oq . (1)1 €0y omSEg W Ppereopu wet) sfurreo] sadeop anmber fewr yidap om0 oYL ‘G
. e
D IPQTE D SHI D621 D 06 D €L D T9 D ‘65 D ‘vE D ISV Wol PAUTAII0ISD 0 [[BYS SHum ATTOSEUE O oppad 94, ((£)Z 10£¥ 9181 WOl POUIULIS)ap 58 9}IdT05 10]  BI0ASS, 10 (AreIspour,  foqisnsau,,
“¥apur FULagIEaM ST M UF DI 24 [[EYS Twmjod Supagieam ST, "apod si1 Jo siusmaniha [BImonns au) AJSnes 0] A1esso0ou Uer; ATHOSETI J0 opp.S 10 21910000 JISuans USH € annbar few Sumomes 8
- ADS S/ { () = Moy Iad ST | ‘B 6.0 0 = 300F arenbs jod punod [ S 10
d*55 1 (LN FI/9T/T Y/N ds5 “POW| .O0E | "AdS Y. ~ON OR ON 06 0E
(dNEL X3aNI aTHINDI W3 L LoD, SR | b eeep | ANODALYD | w2HOZSUgSp | uolbau +SIO24S (udu) | Gy
B | NN | onzmmua | STVIYH | \iavreaann | Neisaa | MU | sunisor | PUHOREOM | MG | Swoapuim | pum erpeds | swdeiodey | 09s0s | wons
NYan il IREYL 301 YALNIM WOY4 IDVIAVA Ol 153raas olSIS NOISHA ANIM ANNOUD

VINI LD NOISTA DIHVYO0TD ANV JLLYINITD
(O AR ERETAT

29

2015 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE®
Copyright to, or licensed by, ICC (ALL RIGHTS RESERVED); accessed by Mike Morgan on Jul 30, 2014 1:22:03 PM pursuant to License Agreement. No further reproductions authorized.




ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF MARSHALL, MISSOURI ADOPTING THE 2020
EDITION OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE, REGULATING AND
GOVERNING THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION, QUALITY OF MATERIALS,
ERECTION, INSTALLATION, ALTERATION, REPAIR, LOCATION, RELOCATION,
REPLACEMENT, ADDITION TO, USE OR MAINTENANCE OF ELECTRICAL
SYSTEMS IN THE CITY OF MARSHALL, MISSOURI; PROVIDING FOR THE
ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND COLLECTION OF FEES THEREFOR; REPEALING
ORDINANCE NO. 8243 AND ALL OTHER ORDINANCES OR PARTS OF LAWS IN
CONFLICT THEREWITH.

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, as follows:

Section 1. Adoption of Electrical Code. That a certain document, one (1) digital copy of
which is on file in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall, being marked and designated as
the National Electrical Code, 2020 edition, as published by the National Electrical Code
Committee, be and is hereby adopted as the Electrical Code of the City of Marshall, Missouri,
regulating and governing the design, construction, quality of materials, erection, installation,
alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use, testing or maintenance of
electrical systems as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees
therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said
Electrical Code on file in the office of the Clerk of the City of Marshall, Missouri are hereby
referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Ordinance, with the additions,
insertions, deletions and changes, if any prescribe in this Ordinance.

Section 2. Additions, Insertions and Changes. That the sections of the Electrical Code
are hereby revised: that all references in said Code to the “authority having jurisdiction” shall mean
the City of Marshall, Missouri.

Section 3. Inconsistent Ordinances Repealed. That Ordinance No. 8234 and all other
ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 4. Appeal from Decision of Building Official. That all appeals from the decisions
of the Building Official concerning the application, interpretation or implementation of the
National Electric Code, 2020 edition, shall be taken to the City of Marshall Board of Building
Code Enforcement. Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the Building Official
relative to the application and interpretation of this Code shall be heard by the City of Marshall
Board of Building Code Enforcement, as established, adopted and amended from time to time by
the City of Marshall, Missouri. The Board of Building Code Enforcement shall follow the practices
and procedures established for the Board of Building Code Enforcement.

Section 5. Partial Invalidity. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase
of this ordinance is, for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the
validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance. The Council hereby declares that it would
have passed this ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of



the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared
unconstitutional.

Section 6. Savings Clause. That nothing in this Ordinance or in the Electrical Code hereby
adopted shall be construed to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or any rights
acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act
or Ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 3 of this Ordinance; nor shall any just or legal
right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this Ordinance. If any suit or
proceeding, either administrative or judicial, is pending at the time of the enactment of this
Ordinance, the provisions of the repealed Ordinance shall apply to all actions taken on or before
the date of the enactment of this Ordinance, and the newly enacted Ordinance shall apply to all
actions taken in such cause or proceeding after the date of the enactment of this Ordinance.

Section 7. Date of Effect. That this Ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions,
requirements, orders and matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full
force and effect from and after the date of its final passage and adoption.

PASSED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, this  day of ,2023.
President

APPROVED by the Mayor this  day of , 2023.
Mayor

FILED this __ day of , 2023.

City Clerk



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING AND DIRECTING THE MAYOR OF THE CITY OF
MARSHALL, MISSOURI, TO EXECUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE CITY OF
MARSHALL AND JD KEHRMAN EXTENDING HIS EMPLOYMENT AS THE CITY
ADMINISTRATOR OF THE CITY OF MARSHALL.

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, as follows:
Section 1. That the Mayor of the City of Marshall, Missouri, is hereby authorized to
execute on behalf of said City a contract with JD Kehrman, setting forth the terms and conditions

of his continued employment as the City Administrator of the City of Marshall.

Section 2. That this Ordinance shall be in full force and effect upon final passage and
approval.

PASSED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, this _ day of ,2023.
President

APPROVED by the Mayor this  day of ,2023.
Mayor

FILED this  day of ,2023.

City Clerk



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING AND DIRECTING THE INTERNAL TRANSFER OF
BALANCES BETWEEN CERTAIN CITY FUNDS

WHEREAS, pursuant to Section 67.050, RSMo., a political subdivision may transfer any
unencumbered balance or portion thereof from the expenditure authorization of one department,
office, commission, or other classification to another, subject to such limitations as may be
provided by law or charter; and

WHEREAS, the City of Marshall now desires to authorize the transfer of certain funds
within the Municipal Services Department for the purposes stated below.

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, as follows:

Section 1. The City Administrator, or his designee, is hereby authorized and directed to
transfer funds from the City’s Sanitation Fund to the City’s Street Fund in the total sum of One
Million and 00/100ths Dollars ($1,000,000.00). The City Administrator, or his designee, is hereby
further authorized and directed to complete additional transfers of One Million and 00/100ths
Dollars ($1,000,000.00) from the City’s Sanitation Fund to the City’s Street Fund in years 2024
and 2025. In each of said years, the additional transfers shall occur within thirty (30) days of the
anniversary date of the final passage and approval of this ordinance.

Section 2. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect upon final passage and approval.

PASSED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, this day of ,2023.
President

APPROVED by the Mayor  this day of , 2023.
Mayor

FILED this day of day of ,2023.

City Clerk



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE MAKING THE APPROPRIATION FOR THE PAYMENT OF ACCOUNTS OUT
OF THE DIFFERENT CITY FUNDS.

BE IT ORDAINED by the Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, as follows:

SECTION I. There is hereby appropriated out of the different funds as follows:

GENERAL FUND $ 154,383.88
SANITATION FUND 5,008.53
LIBRARY FUND 6,609.75
BAND FUND 5,848.99
PARK FUND 18,861.22
CITY OFFICE/REVITALIZATION

STREET FUND 57,169.87
AIRPORT CPERATING FUND 2,975.53
TOURISM

MARTIN COMMUNITY CENTER 930.23
HAB CENTER FUND 22,954.59
PARK CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT 18,228.67

SOUTH ODELL SEWER
AMERICAN RESCUE PLAN

WATER OPERATING FUND $ 184,420.35
ELECTRIC OPERATING FUND 1,058,828.50
SEWER REVENUE FUND 310,400.24
INTERNET OPERATING FUND 95,362.36
NATURAL GAS OPERATING FUND 2,701.88

ELECTRIC CONSUMER DEPOSIT FUND -
SEWER EQUIPMENT FUND -
WATER SEGREGATED -

SECTION Il. The City Clerk is hereby instructed to make out warrants in favor of the respective parties set
out in the hereto attached lists and when said warrants are properly signed to deliver them to the proper parties.

PASSED by the City Council of the City of Marshall, Missouri, this 21st day of FEBRUARY, 2023.

President of the City Council

APPROVED by the Mayor of the City of Marshall, Missouri, this 21st day of FEBRUARY, 2023.

Mayor
FILED this 21st day of FEBRUARY, 2023.

City Clerk



	Item 23. Ord. City Administrator Contract.pdf
	2023 City Administrator Contract - Extension.pdf
	EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENT
	A. Termination Generally. If Employee’s employment under this Agreement is terminated due to Employee’s death, for cause, or pursuant to Employee’s resignation, then City’s obligations under this Agreement, including the payment of salary, expenses, a...
	i. Pay Employee (or his estate) any salary actually earned, accrued, and unpaid through the date of termination;
	ii. Reimburse Employee (or his estate) for all reimbursable, out-of-pocket expenses incurred pursuant to this Agreement, and all vacation leave and other benefits actually due pursuant to this Agreement that are accrued and unpaid through the date of ...
	iii. Indemnify Employee as provided in this Agreement.
	B. Termination Due to Disability. Upon Employee’s termination due to disability, City’s obligations under this Agreement, including the payment of salary, expenses, and benefits, shall end except for the City’s obligation to:
	i. Pay Employee (or his estate) any salary actually earned, accrued, and unpaid through the date of termination;
	ii. Reimburse Employee (or his estate) for all reimbursable, out-of-pocket expenses incurred pursuant to this Agreement, and all vacation leave and other benefits actually due pursuant to this Agreement that are accrued and unpaid through the date of ...
	iii. Indemnify Employee as provided in this Agreement.
	C. Termination Without Cause. If Employee’s employment is terminated by City without cause, in addition to its obligations under Section 11, Paragraph A, City shall pay aggregate compensation for a period of six (6) months and provide the aggregate be...
	D. Expiration of Employment Term. If Employee’s employment under this Agreement terminates other than pursuant to Section 10 of this Agreement (such as, for example, expiration of the term of Employee’s employment under Section 1 of this Agreement), t...
	Section 12. Performance Evaluation City shall annually review the performance of the Employee in or about June subject to a process, form, criteria, and format for the evaluation designated by the Mayor and City Council. The process at a minimum shall...
	Section 13. Hours of Work. It is recognized that the Employee must devote a great deal of time outside the normal office hours on business for the Employer, and to that end Employee shall be allowed to establish an appropriate work schedule.
	Section 14. Outside Activities. The employment provided for by this Agreement shall be the Employee’s sole employment. Recognizing that certain outside consulting or teaching opportunities provide indirect benefits to the Employer and the community, t...
	Section 15. Indemnification. City shall defend and indemnify Employee, using legal counsel of the City’s choosing, against expense or legal liability for acts or omissions by Employee occurring within the course and scope of Employee's employment unde...
	Section 16. Bonding. City shall bear the full cost of any fidelity or other bonds required of the Employee under any law or ordinance.
	Section 17. Other Terms and Conditions of Employment. City, only upon agreement with Employee, shall fix any such other terms and conditions of employment, as it may determine from time to time, relating to the performance of the Employee, provided su...
	Section 18. Notices. Notice pursuant to this Agreement shall be given by depositing in the custody of the United States Postal Service, postage prepaid, addressed as follows:
	A. City:
	Mayor
	City of Marshall, Missouri
	214 N. Lafayette Ave.
	Marshall, MO 65340
	B. Employee:
	JD Kehrman
	___________________
	___________________
	Alternatively, notice required pursuant to this Agreement may be personally served in the same manner as is applicable to civil legal practices. Notice shall be deemed given as of the date of personal service or as the date of deposit of such written ...
	Section 19. General Provisions
	A. Integration. This Agreement sets forth and establishes the entire understanding between City and Employee relating to the employment of Employee by City. Any prior discussions or representations by or between the parties are merged into and superse...
	B. Binding Effect. This Agreement shall be binding on City and Employee as well as their heirs, assigns, executors, personal representatives and successors in interest.
	C. Effective Date. This Agreement shall become effective on the date this Agreement has been signed by all parties.
	D. Severability. The invalidity or partial invalidity of any portion of this Agreement will not affect the validity of any other provision. If any provision of this Agreement is held to be invalid, the remaining provisions shall be deemed to be in ful...
	E. Governing Law. The rights and obligations of the parties to this Agreement shall be governed by the laws of Missouri.
	IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have caused this Agreement to be executed the day and year set forth below.



